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INFORMATION IN RELATION TO COVID-19 (Coronavirus) 22.4.2020

Dear Member,

Firstly, thank you for your continued patience and co-operation in observing the
Covid19 conditions. It goes without saying that this is one of, if not, the most
challenging time in our Clubs’ history. 

The restrictions we have had to deal with are unprecedented, so we’ve had to be
flexible with an amount of operational trial and error. For example, we moved the
pro shop operations to outside in an effort to manage a free flow in the checking
in process. Whilst this had some merit, we consider it is not sustainable in the
longer term and even more challenging in inclement weather. The staff have
moved back into the pro shop and with extra signage, increased number of
distance markers and most of all your co-operation it is working as well as can be
expected. 

As we said in our last communication, we are trying to be as fair as possible to all
members in the allocation of competition time slots, particularly on the most
popular days of Wednesday, Saturday and Sunday. We had intended to introduce
‘9 hole’ competitions on those three days, particularly as we approach shorter
daylight hours. The feedback from members has been in favour of continuing with
‘18 hole’ competitions, but with restrictions on players booking in for more than
one of those days. 

In response to the feedback, we have put the idea of a ‘9 hole comp’ on the
backburner and will introduce the following conditions for Wednesday, Saturday
and Sunday competitions commencing from Wednesday the 29th April.

· Members will be restricted to ‘one live booking’ for Wednesday, Saturday or
Sunday competitions within any calendar week.
· Tee Bookings will be monitored by Club Administration and players booked into
a second competition will be removed from the time sheet and receive an email
notification. 
· A player may book into a subsequent competition in the same week after
8:00pm on the day they have played. 
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· If there is a vacancy 24 hours prior to the competition hit-off you may book in. 
· This restriction applies only to Wednesday, Saturday and Sunday competitions.
Players can book into multiple other competitions held during the week.

For more information on the changes being implemented please view the Q&A
documents on the link below.

COVID-19 - Wednesday, Saturday & Sunday Bookings Q&A

SOCIAL DISTANCING
We remind you to observe social distancing rules at all times, including avoiding
gathering on or near tees, around the pro shop and in the car park. Police were at
the course last Thursday looking for infringements and could return at any time.
Please do the right thing or you may cop the consequences. 

We’re sure you appreciate that this is a fluid situation and that we are doing our
best to look after the majority of if not all members. Let us know if you have any
questions, concerns or suggestions and they will all be given due consideration.
Meanwhile, stay safe and enjoy your golf.

Denis Clifford 
Club President

Paul Hilton
Club Captain 

If you have any specific concerns or questions, we recommend you refer to NSW
Health website, which is updated frequently
https://www.health.nsw.gov.au/Infectious/alerts/Pages/coronavirus-faqs.aspx
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